
Descendants of David Dill McCain 

  

Generation No. 1 

1. DAVID  DILL
5 MCCAIN  (JAMES

4, JOHN
3, JAMES

2, DONALD
1) was born 04-June-1812 in Warren Co., Ohio, 

and died 06-September-1855 in Carrollton Township, Carroll County, Indiana. He married (1) MARY 
LEFEVRE

1 11-May-1837 in Warren County, Ohio, daughter of ELIAS LEFEVRE and CATHERINE 
CRAVER. She was born 15-September-1815 in Warren County, Ohio, and died 18-August-1842 in Carroll 
Co., Indiana. He married (2) ESTHER DILLON

2,3 01-February-1844 in Carroll Co., Indiana. She was born 14-
January-1816 in Junita Co., Pennsylvania, and died 24-July-1898 in Carroll Co., Indiana. 

Notes for DAVID  DILL  MCCAIN: 
Western Star Newspaper, Warren County, Ohio, 21 Sept., 1855 
DIED On the 6th inst. in Carroll Co., Indiana, David D. McCain, son of James McCain, 
dec., formerly of this county, aged 43 years. 
 
More About DAVID  DILL  MCCAIN: 
Burial: McCain Cemetery 
Cemetery: McCain Cemetery 
Property: 1837, Bought land in Carroll County, Indiana 
More About MARY LEFEVRE: 
Burial: McCain Cemetery, Carrollton Twp, Carroll Co., Indiana 
More About DAVID  MCCAIN and MARY LEFEVRE: 
Marriage: 11-May-1837, Warren County, Ohio 
Marriage license: 1837, Licence #4867 

More About ESTHER DILLON: 

Burial: McCain Cemetery 

Cemetery: McCain Cemetery 

Living With: 1880, Sons John and William McCain 

More About DAVID  MCCAIN and ESTHER DILLON : 

Marriage: 01-February-1844, Carroll Co., Indiana 

Married By: William Reese 

Children of DAVID  MCCAIN and MARY LEFEVRE are: 

i. CATHERINE ANN6 MCCAIN, b. 30-August-1840; d. Unknown. 

More About CATHERINE ANN MCCAIN: 

Individual Note: 1854, Named in her Grandfather's will 



ii. JOHN MCCAIN, b. 25-February-1838, Warren County, Ohio; d. 20-August-1839, Carroll Co., Indiana. 

Children of DAVID  MCCAIN and ESTHER DILLON are: 

iii. MARY E.6 MCCAIN4, b. 24-October-1844, Indiana5; d. Unknown. 

2. iv. SUSAN M. MCCAIN, b. 20-November-1847, Carrollton Twsp., Carroll County, Indiana; d. 19-
December-1928, Carrollton Twsp., Carroll County, Indiana. 

v. MAHALA F. MCCAIN, b. 30-January-1850, Carrollton Township, Carroll County, Indiana5; d. 01-July-
1856, Carrollton Township, Carroll County, Indiana. 

More About MAHALA F. MCCAIN: 

Burial: McCain Cemetery, Carrollton Twp, Carroll Co., Indiana 

vi. SARAH H. MCCAIN, b. 29-October-1851, Carrollton Township, Carroll County, Indiana; d. 04-
August-1856, Carroll Co., Indiana. 

More About SARAH H. MCCAIN: 

Burial: McCain Cemetery, Carrollton Twp, Carroll Co., Indiana 

3. vii. DAVID JOHN MCCAIN, b. 08-November-1854, Carroll County, Indiana; d. 11-June-1949, Flora, 
Carroll Co., Indiana. 

viii. JESSE F. MCCAIN, b. 01-January-1856, Carrollton Township, Carroll County, Indiana; d. 14-
January-1856, Carrollton Township, Carroll County, Indiana. 

4. ix. WILLIAM F. MCCAIN, b. 01-January-1856, Carroll County, Indiana; d. 1927, Carroll County, 
Indiana. 

  

Generation No. 2 

2. SUSAN M.
6 MCCAIN  (DAVID DILL

5, JAMES
4, JOHN

3, JAMES
2, DONALD

1)6,7,8 was born 20-November-1847 in 
Carrollton Twsp., Carroll County, Indiana9, and died 19-December-1928 in Carrollton Twsp., Carroll 
County, Indiana. She married WILLIAM  JASPER LANDES

10,11,12,13 27-September-1879 in Carroll Co., Indiana, 
son of JOHN LANDES and JULIA  DUNKIN. He was born 22-May-1852 in Carrollton Twsp, Carroll Co., 
Indiana, and died 25-February-1915 in Carrollton Twsp, Carroll Co., Indiana. 

Notes for SUSAN M. MCCAIN: 

William Jasper Landes married 27 Sept 1879 Susan M. McCain a 

teacher born 20 Nov 1847 Carrollton Twp Carroll Co IN she died 19 Dec 1928 

both buried Sharon Cem. 

Susan M. was the dau of David Dill McCain {his first wife was Mary Lefever 

McCain. she died 1842} his second wife if the mother of Susan M. she was 

Esther Dillen b. 14 Jan 1816 Junita Co Pa. Esther 24 July 1898 they are 



buried in the McCain Cem. I have more detail of the McCain pedigree if 

you 

want it.......My grt grt grandmother was a McCain also. Doris 

More About SUSAN M. MCCAIN: 

Cemetery: Beech Grove Cemetery, Sharon, Indiana 

Occupation: Teacher 

Notes for WILLIAM  JASPER LANDES: 

DEATH OF WM. J. LANDES A SEVERE BLOW TO COUNTY 

TRUSTEE OF CARROLLTON TOWNSHIP DIED AT HOME EAST OF CITY OF FRIDAY 

W. J. Landes, one of the most highly respected and widely known citizen-farmers of Carroll County, and 
trustee of Carrollton Township, died at his home east of this city Friday morning at 5:30 o'clock after a 
week's illness of pneumonia, complicated with other ailments from which he had been a sufferer for a 
number of years. Deceased met with an accident at Indianapolis Dec. 8, the results of which it is thought 
contributed largely to his death. he fell unconscious in attempting to alight from a street car and his injuries 
were of such a serious nature that he was confined in a hospital in that city for a week before being brought 
home. For some time after being brought home he was in a critical condition, at one period of his illness his 
friends fearing for the worst. But with careful nursing and the skill of the best physicians he gradually 
began to improve and several weeks ago there was such a marked change in his condition that he was able 
to leave his home and transact some official business connected with his office, and attend to the regular 
routine of home and farm affairs.  

His many friends, however, began to hope for his ultimate recovery, but one week before his death he was 
stricken with pneumonia. A nurse was called and everything the nurse, physicians, family and friends could 
do was done to combat the disease, but he gradually grew worse until the end. 

William Jasper Landes was a son of John and Julia A. Landes, and was born on the old Landes homestead 
in Carrollton Township, May 22, 1852, at the time of his death being 63 years, 9 months and 3 days of age. 
From birth he had resided continuously on the farm where he died, with the exception of a year's temporary 
residence with his family in California. 

In his earlier life Mr. landes followed the profession of school teaching, and for twenty-seven years taught 
in the schools of the county. Many of the middle aged residents of Carrollton Township and other parts of 
the county can vividly recall many pleasant incidents connected with their school life when Mr. Landes was 
their instructor. In his day Mr. Landes was considered one of the foremost educators of the county and 
always took a leading part in any movement to promote the best interests of the public schools. 

When only fifteen years of age deceased united with the Sharon Baptist Church and throughout his entire 
life lived a dedicated and faithful member. He was one of the most active members of the Sharon 
congregation and at the time of his death held the offices of Trustee and Deacon. For many years he was 
secretary of the Judson Baptist Association and through his untiring efforts and devotion to the work 
assigned him the Association grew to be one of the important factors in promoting the best interest of the 
church in many parts of the state. 



At the time of his death deceased was Trustee of Carrollton Township and he was a careful and painstaking 
official whose whole aim was for the best interests of the schools and its patrons. For some time before his 
death, however, he was unable to transact the business connected with his office, the affairs of the office 
being left to others. In his earlier life Mr. Landes traveled quite extensively and was well informed on 
important topics. 

He was a man of the highest moral, religious and intellectual character and the absence of his influence will 
be keenly felt in this community where he resided and the county at large. 

By his careful business methods he had obtained a goodly share of this world's goods, at the time of his 
death owning one of the best farms in Carrollton Township. 

Deceased leaves to mourn a wife and one daughter, Jessie; two brothers, Oscar of this city; and Frank of 
North Carolina, besides a large number of other relatives and friends. The funeral was conducted at the 
Sharon Baptist Church Sunday at 11 o'clock, conducted by the Rev. Essicks, pastor, and was largely 
attended, many relatives and friends coming from a distance. County Superintendent P. B. Hemming and 
the twelve township trustees, constituting the County Board of Education, attended the funeral as a body. 
Interment was made in the Sharon Cemetery. 

+++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++ 

William Jasper Landes married 27 Sept 1879 Susan M. McCain a 

teacher born 20 Nov 1847 Carrollton Twp Carroll Co IN she died 19 Dec 1928 

both buried Sharon Cem. 

Susan M. was the dau of David Dill McCain {his first wife was Mary Lefever 

McCain. she died 1842} his second wife if the mother of Susan M. she was 

Esther Dillen b. 14 Jan 1816 Junita Co Pa. Esther 24 July 1898 they are 

buried in the McCain Cem. I have more detail of the McCain pedigree if 

you 

want it.......My grt grt grandmother was a McCain also. Doris 

More About WILLIAM  JASPER LANDES: 

Address (Facts Pg): 1910, Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana 

Cause of Death (Facts Pag: Pneumonia 

Cemetery: Beech Grove Cemetery, Sharon, Indiana 

Elected: Carrollton Twsp. Trustee 

Living With: 1880, His father, John Landes 

Occupation: School Teacher 



More About WILLIAM  LANDES and SUSAN MCCAIN: 

Marriage: 27-September-1879, Carroll Co., Indiana 

Child of SUSAN MCCAIN and WILLIAM  LANDES is: 

i. JESSIE7 LANDES13, b. Abt. 1888, Carrollton Twsp, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. Unknown; m. WILLIAM 
SPITLER, May-1935; b. Abt. 1888, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. Unknown. 

Notes for JESSIE LANDES: 

MISS JESSIE LANDIS LEADS 

The Hoosier Democrat offered a year's subscription and a pack of fine name cards to the pupil writing the 
best composition on "The Hoosier Democrat." The offer was open to the Senior Composition Class of the 
Flora High Schools, and Miss Jessie Landis, daughter of Jasper Landis, of Carrollton Township, carried 
away the honors. The other compositions are creditable. Miss Landis' composition follows: 

THE HOOSIER DEMOCRAT--WHY IT LEADS 

Six papers are published in the county, but the Hoosier Democrat leads in almost every respect. 

It leads because it published the most news of any paper in the county. It gathers news from "Dan to 
Beersheba." It has correspondents in almost every locality in the county, who send in those newsy little 
items that please the public so well. 

The Democrat has a very enterprising, hustling corps of editors and reporters. They get out their paper in a 
neat and attractive style, and it is always on time. Holiday week two editions of the paper were published 
showing the enterprise of the editors who are among the most popular citizens of Flora and enjoy the honor 
of having the most complete and up-to-date printing plant of any printing establishment in Carroll County.  

The Democrat is only five years of age and has the distinction of enjoying a larger circulation than most of 
the weekly papers that are published at the county seats in the state. It is because of its newsiness that it has 
2,750 subscribers. 

People who once lived in Carroll County, and have gone to other counties or states, subscribe for the 
Democrat because they say they can get more home news in it. It is published later in the week and thus 
contains the latest. It reaches the busy farmer on Saturday, and he can sit down in the evening, after the 
week's work is done, and enjoy his paper. 

The office is situated on one of the principal streets of the town and is on the first floor, thus making it 
convenient to all parties having business with the paper. The Democrat also offers excellent club rates with 
many standard publications. 

The news is written up in a simple, straight forward manner, yet in good English, so that all classes of 
people can apprecaite it. The people of Flora are enterprising and know a good thing when they see it and 
they all watch the Democart for the news. 

JESSIE LANDIS [JANUARY, 1903] 

+++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++ 

JESSIE LANDES AND WM. SPITLER ARE UNITED IN MARRIAGE [1935] 

A wedding that came as a pleasant surprise to the many friends was that of William Spitler and Miss Jessie 
Landes, well known and popular local residents, which was solemnized last Saturday evening at 7 o'clock 
at the Christian parsonage on South Division Street. The ceremony was performed by Rev. W.C. 
Aschanhort and was witnessed by Mr. and Mrs. Harry Spitler and daughter Jeanne, Mr. and Mrs. Glae 
Cook, Mr. and Mrs. Manford Wagoner and son, Verl, and Miss Rosella Shankland. Following the 
ceremony the couple and guests went to the bride's property on East Main Street, where refreshments were 
served. Mr. Spitler is a member of the firm of Spitler & Son, cattle dealers of Flora. He is a member of the 
Christian Church. The bride is a daughter of the late Mr. and Mrs. Jasper Landes. She graduated from the 



Carrollton and Flora High Schools, since which time she has taught in the Flora, Carrollton, Young 
America and Burlington schools. She is a member of the Baptist Church. They will reside in the groom's 
property on South Center Street, where they are now at home to their many friends. The Democrat unites 
with the many acquaintances in extending to the couple the usual well wishes and hearty congratulations. 

  

Notes for WILLIAM SPITLER: 

JESSIE LANDES AND WM. SPITLER ARE UNITED IN MARRIAGE [1935] 

A wedding that came as a pleasant surprise to the many friends was that of William Spitler and Miss Jessie 
Landes, well known and popular local residents, which was solemnized last Saturday evening at 7 o'clock 
at the Christian parsonage on South Division Street. The ceremony was performed by Rev. W.C. 
Aschanhort and was witnessed by Mr. and Mrs. Harry Spitler and daughter Jeanne, Mr. and Mrs. Glae 
Cook, Mr. and Mrs. Manford Wagoner and son, Verl, and Miss Rosella Shankland. Following the 
ceremony the couple and guests went to the bride's property on East Main Street, where refreshments were 
served. Mr. Spitler is a member of the firm of Spitler & Son, cattle dealers of Flora. He is a member of the 
Christian Church. The bride is a daughter of the late Mr. and Mrs. Jasper Landes. She graduated from the 
Carrollton and Flora High Schools, since which time she has taught in the Flora, Carrollton, Young 
America and Burlington schools. She is a member of the Baptist Church. They will reside in the groom's 
property on South Center Street, where they are now at home to their many friends. The Democrat unites 
with the many acquaintances in extending to the couple the usual well wishes and hearty congratulations. 

More About WILLIAM SPITLER and JESSIE LANDES: 

Marriage: May-1935 

  

3. DAVID  JOHN
6 MCCAIN  (DAVID DILL

5, JAMES
4, JOHN

3, JAMES
2, DONALD

1)14,15,16,17 was born 08-November-
1854 in Carroll County, Indiana, and died 11-June-1949 in Flora, Carroll Co., Indiana. He married ELLEN 
FLORA

18,19 11-November-1882 in Carroll County, Indiana, daughter of ABRAHAM  FLORA and LYDIA  
BRUBAKER. She was born 11-November-1861 in Monroe Twsp., Carroll County, Indiana, and died Abt. 
1952 in Carroll Co., Indiana. 

Notes for DAVID  JOHN MCCAIN: 

FROM THE FLORA PAPER 

COUPLE IN CARROLLTON TOWNSHIP WILL OBSERVE 60TH WEDDING DATE 

DELPHI, IND.,-- Nov. 6, (Tribune Area Special) Mr. and Mrs. J. D. McCain will celebrate their 60th 
wedding anniversary at their home in Carrollton Township on Wednesday, November 11, Armistice Day. 
The McCains were married at the home of Rev. Harvey Todd who performed the ceremony. 

Mr. McCain will be 89 years of age on November 8 and his wife will be 81 years old on November 12. 
Parents of Mrs. McCain, Elder Abraham Flora and Lydia Brubaker Flora, were pioneer residents of 
Monroe Township and at one time owned a large part of the land on which the town of Flora is now 
located. The McCains have resided on the same farm continuously since their marriage 60 years ago. 

The celebrants are known and beloved for their interest in comunity affairs and in the local life of the 
township where they have spent the greater part of their lives. Mr. McCain was trustee from 1895 to 1900. 

Musicians both, the McCains have contributed to the musical development, not only of Carrollton 
Township, but also of Carroll County, and Mr. McCain considers the introduction of music into rural 
schools as his crowning achievement while trustee. He also established the Carrollton Township High 



School. Both Mr. and Mrs. McCain were members of the Wheeling Choral Union, the former having been 
a charter member of the organization. 

Both have been active in religious work. Both lifelong members of the Sharon Baptist Church with Mr. 
McCain acting as chorister for sixty years and teaching a Sunday School class for nearly as long a period. 

The McCains have six children, twenty grandchildren and six great grandchildren. Three of the 
grandchildren are in military service, two of them are overseas. 

Mr. and Mrs. McCain will be honor guests at the homecoming festivities of the Sharon Baptist Church, 
Carrollton Township, on Sunday, Nov. 8.  

++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++ 

SIXTY-SECOND ANNIVERSARY SATURDAY 

FLORA, IND., NOV. 10---Mr. and Mrs. D. John McCain, of R.R. 1, whose sixty second wedding 
anniversary is Saturday, will be one of the couples honored at an all day program at the Sharon Baptist 
Church. The other couples are Mr. and Mrs. J. Billiard, who have been married sixty one years and Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Kuns, who have been married sixty years. 

Wednesday was the 91st birthday of Mr. McCain, a retired Carroll County farmer, while Sunday will be 
Mrs. McCain's 82nd birthday. Both Mr. and Mrs. McCain are natives of Carroll County, Mr. McCain has 
resided in the same home during his entire life. His parents were David and Esther McCain. 

McCain, chorister of the Sharon Baptist Church for more than 50 years, is a former trustee of Carrollton 
Township and is credited with having inaugurated the teaching of music in the Carrollton Township school. 
Mrs. McCain also is well known as a vocalist. Three of their six children are school teachers. George, at 
Delphi; Carl,at Flora and Frank, principal of the Noble Township, Cass County school. Their other children 
are Edwin, Clinton County; Reid, Russiaville and Mrs. Manford Wagoner, near Rockfield. They also have 
twenty grandchildren, of whom ten are in the armed forces and eight great grandchildren. 

The program at the Sharon Baptist Church at which they will be honored will include a morning service at 
10 o'clock at which the Rev. J. E. Yarian will speak and special choral singing will be featured. Following a 
basket dinner at noon, the afternoon program will consist of congregational singing, address by J. H. 
Mitchell, former pastor; history of the church by Mrs. J.E. Yarian; solo, "I Love You Truly", by Edith 
Rodkey and Choral singing of "Italia" in review of choral revival meetings. The afternoon speaker will be 
introduced by the Rev. J.E. Yarian. (1944) 

+++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++ 

D.J. MCCAIN DIES AT HOME EAST OF FLORA [JUNE 11, 1949] 

FUNERAL RITES TO BE CONDUCTED MONDAY MORNING WITH BURIAL IN SHARON 
CEMETERY 

FLORA, IND., JUNE 11---D. John McCain, 95, well known Carroll County farmer, who was credited with 
being the first township trustee in Indiana to include music courses in rural schools, expired at 9:30 o'clock 
last night in the home in which he was born, three miles east of Flora. 

He served as trustee of Carrollton Township from 1895 to 1900. He also was a charter member of the 
Wheeling Choral Union, and a trustee of the Sharon Baptist Church. He had long been active in the church, 
serving both as chorister and as a Sunday School teacher for more than sixty years. The deceased was born 



Nov. 8, 1853, the son of David and Esther Dillon McCain, and had resided all of his life on the same farm. 
He was a vocal techer as a young man. 

MARRIED 65 YEARS 

He and his wife, the former Ella Flora, whose parents owned a large part of the land on which the town of 
Flora is now located, celebrated their sixty-sixth wedding anniversary last November 11. They were 
married Nov. 11, 1882, at the home of the Rev. Harvey Todd in Carrollton Township. Besides the widow , 
he is survived by forty five direct descendants, including six children, twenty grandchildren, and nineteen 
great grandchildren. 

Surviving children are Mrs. Manford Wagoner, Delphi; George W., Delphi; Carl B., Flora; Edwin D., 
Frankfort; J. Reed, Brookston; and Frank K., Flora. The body was scheduled to be returned to the residence 
from the Leiter Funeral Home at 4:30 o'clock Saturday afternoon. Rites will be held at 10:30 o'clock DST 
Monday morning at Wheeling Presbyterian Church because the Baptist Church is undergoing remodeling. 
Burial will be in the Sharon Cemetery. 

More About DAVID  JOHN MCCAIN: 

Address (Facts Pg): 1910, Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana 

Occupation: 1880, Farmer 

Notes for ELLEN FLORA: 

COUPLE IN CARROLLTON TOWNSHIP WILL OBSERVE 60TH WEDDING DATE 

DELPHI, IND.,-- Nov. 6, (Tribune Area Special) Mr. and Mrs. J. D. McCain will celebrate their 60th 
wedding anniversary at their home in Carrollton Township on Wednesday, November 11, Armistice Day. 
The McCains were married at the home of Rev. Harvey Todd who performed the ceremony. 

Mr. McCain will be 89 years of age on November 8 and his wife will be 81 years old on November 12. 
Parents of Mrs. McCain, Elder Abraham Flora and Lydia Brubaker Flora, were pioneer residents of 
Monroe Township and at one time owned a large part of the land on which the town of Flora is now 
located. The McCains have resided on the same farm continuously since their marriage 60 years ago. 

The celebrants are known and beloved for their interest in comunity affairs and in the local life of the 
township where they have spent the greater part of their lives. Mr. McCain was trustee from 1895 to 1900. 

Musicians both, the McCains have contributed to the musical development, not only of Carrollton 
Township, but also of Carroll County, and Mr. McCain considers the introduction of music into rural 
schools as his crowning achievement while trustee. He also established the Carrollton Township High 
School. Both Mr. and Mrs. McCain were members of the Wheeling Choral Union, the former having been 
a charter member of the organization. 

Both have been active in religious work. Both lifelong members of the Sharon Baptist Church with Mr. 
McCain acting as chorister for sixty years and teaching a Sunday School class for nearly as long a period. 

The McCains have six children, twenty grandchildren and six great grandchildren. Three of the 
grandchildren are in military service, two of them are overseas. 

Mr. and Mrs. McCain will be honor guests at the homecoming festivities of the Sharon Baptist Church, 
Carrollton Township, on Sunday, Nov. 8.  



+++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++ 

SIXTY-SECOND ANNIVERSARY SATURDAY 

FLORA, IND., NOV. 10---Mr. and Mrs. D. John McCain, of R.R. 1, whose sixty second wedding 
anniversary is Saturday, will be one of the couples honored at an all day program at the Sharon Baptist 
Church. The other couples are Mr. and Mrs. J. Billiard, who have been married sixty one years and Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Kuns, who have been married sixty years. 

Wednesday was the 91st birthday of Mr. McCain, a retired Carroll County farmer, while Sunday will be 
Mrs. McCain's 82nd birthday. Both Mr. and Mrs. McCain are natives of Carroll County, Mr. McCain has 
resided in the same home during his entire life. His parents were David and Esther McCain. 

McCain, chorister of the Sharon Baptist Church for more than 50 years, is a former trustee of Carrollton 
Township and is credited with having inaugurated the teaching of music in the Carrollton Township school. 
Mrs. McCain also is well known as a vocalist. Three of their six children are school teachers. George, at 
Delphi; Carl,at Flora and Frank, principal of the Noble Township, Cass County school. Their other children 
are Edwin, Clinton County; Reid, Russiaville and Mrs. Manford Wagoner, near Rockfield. They also have 
twenty grandchildren, of whom ten are in the armed forces and eight great grandchildren. 

The program at the Sharon Baptist Church at which they will be honored will include a morning service at 
10 o'clock at which the Rev. J. E. Yarian will speak and special choral singing will be featured. Following a 
basket dinner at noon, the afternoon program will consist of congregational singing, address by J. H. 
Mitchell, former pastor; history of the church by Mrs. J.E. Yarian; solo, "I Love You Truly", by Edith 
Rodkey and Choral singing of "Italia" in review of choral revival meetings. The afternoon speaker will be 
introduced by the Rev. J.E. Yarian. 

More About DAVID  MCCAIN and ELLEN FLORA: 

Marriage: 11-November-1882, Carroll County, Indiana 

Children of DAVID  MCCAIN and ELLEN FLORA are: 

i. FLORA MATERNA7 MCCAIN20,21, b. 24-October-1883, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. 10-January-1984, 
Carroll Co., Indiana; m. MANFORD A. WAGONER22,23, 18-August-1923, Carroll Co., Indiana; b. 10-
September-1882, Flora, Carroll Co., IN; d. Unknown, Carroll Co., Indiana. 

More About FLORA MATERNA MCCAIN: 

Address (Facts Pg): 1910, Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana 

Occupation: 1910, Music Teacher 

More About MANFORD A. WAGONER: 

Address (Facts Pg): 1910, Carrollton Twp, Carroll Co., Indiana 

Occupation: 1910, Farmer 

More About MANFORD WAGONER and FLORA MCCAIN: 

Marriage: 18-August-1923, Carroll Co., Indiana 

ii. GEORGE W. MCCAIN24, b. Abt. 1885, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. Unknown; m. LEONA BARNHART, 
Columbus, Indiana; b. Unknown, Columbus, Indiana; d. Unknown. 



Notes for GEORGE W. MCCAIN: 

FROM THE FLORA PAPER 

MARRIED IN COLUMBUS 

George W. McCain, son of Mr. and Mrs. D.J. McCain of Carrollton Township, and one of Flora's 
prominent young businessmen, being a member of D.J. McCain & Sons, implement dealers, went to 
Columbus, Ind., Monday where on Tuesday evening he claimed as his bride Miss Leona Barnhart, a 
popular young lady of that city. The wedding took place at the home of the bride's parents in the presence 
of fifty invited guests. The ceremony was performed by the pastor of the First M.E. Church. The marriage 
is the culmination of a courtship started when both the contracting parties were students at Franklin 
College, from which institute they both graduated the same year. 

The bride is a leader in the church and social circles of Columbus and is surrounded by a large circle of 
admiring friends. She has frequently visited at the McCain home and the home of Jasper Landis. 

The groom is a Carroll County boy, all his life prior to coming to Flora being spent in Carrollton Township. 
About a year ago he with his father and brothers, bought the Penn Bros. Implement Business in this city 
and under the firm name of D.J. McCain & Sons, have enjoyed a good business. Immediately after the 
ceremony they left for Cambridge, Ohio, for a short honeymoon. They will return to this city Saturday and 
Sunday an informal dinner will be given at the McCain home in Carrollton Township. They will be at home 
to their friends in the Burns property in this city. The Press extends congratulations. 

More About GEORGE W. MCCAIN: 

Address (Facts Pg): 1910, Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana 

Occupation: School teacher 

Notes for LEONA BARNHART: 

FROM THE FLORA PAPER 

MARRIED IN COLUMBUS 

George W. McCain, son of Mr. and Mrs. D.J. McCain of Carrollton Township, and one of Flora's 
prominent young businessmen, being a member of D.J. McCain & Sons, implement dealers, went to 
Columbus, Ind., Monday where on Tuesday evening he claimed as his bride Miss Leona Barnhart, a 
popular young lady of that city. The wedding took place at the home of the bride's parents in the presence 
of fifty invited guests. The ceremony was performed by the pastor of the First M.E. Church. The marriage 
is the culmination of a courtship started when both the contracting parties were students at Franklin 
College, from which institute they both graduated the same year. 

The bride is a leader in the church and social circles of Columbus and is surrounded by a large circle of 
admiring friends. She has frequently visited at the McCain home and the home of Jasper Landis. 

The groom is a Carroll County boy, all his life prior to coming to Flora being spent in Carrollton Township. 
About a year ago he with his father and brothers, bought the Penn Bros. Implement Business in this city 
and under the firm name of D.J. McCain & Sons, have enjoyed a good business. Immediately after the 
ceremony they left for Cambridge, Ohio, for a short honeymoon. They will return to this city Saturday and 
Sunday an informal dinner will be given at the McCain home in Carrollton Township. They will be at home 
to their friends in the Burns property in this city. The Press extends congratulations. 

More About GEORGE MCCAIN and LEONA BARNHART: 

Church: First M.E. Church, Columbus, Ind. 

Marriage: Columbus, Indiana 

iii. CARL B. MCCAIN24, b. Abt. 1887, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. Unknown. 

Notes for CARL B. MCCAIN: 



CARL MCCAIN WRITES TRIP TO GERMANY 

CARROLLTON TOWNSHIP BOY IS IN BLACK FORESTS TAKING COURSE IN FORESTRY--
TELLS INTERESTING STORY OF TRIP 

When Carl B. McCain, son of Mr. and Mrs. D.J. McCain of Carrollton Township left for Darmstadt, 
Germany, where he is taking a course in the Biltmore Forest School, he told the Press he would let the 
people of Carroll County hear from him through it's columns and we publish the first letter received from 
him. It arrived Tuesday and the envelope was marked "Direckt Weg", meaning direct way or quickest 
route. The letter is very interesting and will interest our may readers. 

Biltmore Forest School 

Darmstadt, Germany, 

Oct. 14, 1912 

Carroll County Press: 

The request has come to me for a letter telling something of my trip to Germany and of the work of the 
Biltmore Forest School. Anyone who has ever been to Europe is at once struck by the difference between 
the American cities, people and customs, and those of Europe. 

We left New York on Oct. 1, on the "New Amsterdam" of the Holland-American Line, and arrived in 
Rotterdam, Holland, on Oct. 10. This vessel is one of the easiest vessels to cross the Atlantic on. 

We didn't see a great deal of Rotterdam, but it surely is a quaint city. The streets do not run straight, but 
wind in every direction. Canals are seen everywhere and boats are busy carrying all sorts of commerce 
from place to place. One who has been used to American cities where drays carry everything wonders at 
the Dutch way of carrying and wheeling almost every sort of a load on hand carts. The stores are full of all 
sorts of trinkets and attractive objects. The Dutch are a very energetic people 

We left Rotterdam on the State railway for Darmstadt early Friday morning, Oct. 11, and rode all day. The 
sight of the German trains is almost laughable to an American. The engines are all built in England, and are 
of English type. The passenger cars are about as long as an average freight car in America and only a few 
have a passage way into other cars. The couplers are simple hooks and a brakeman takes his life in his 
hands when he couples one car to another one. The freight cars are really amusing; they leave single tracks 
and look more like wagons than freight cars. We boys wished we might see an engine of the Pacific type 
pulling a modern American train, rolling by. We actually saw two men pushing a car half full of coal. One 
is struck by the number of uniformed persons he sees. It must be remembered that the govermnent own and 
operate most of the railway systems in Europe. 

The trip through Holland with its canals, windmills, low flat land, gardens and small forest tracts was full 
of interest. One could imagine he was on the western plains from the flatness of the land and the many 
cattle he sees. The American people could learn a little from the Dutch, in their methods of conservation. 
We saw many peasants wearing the wooden shoes for which Holland is famed. 

The ride through Germany until we came to Koln was through some of the best agricultural and factory 
sections of Germany. We saw women, children and men working in the fields everywhere. I don't 
remember seeing a two horse wagon anywhere. Everywhere we saw horses and sometimes cows pulling 
carts. 

We came to the Rhine at Cologne. Here we had a glympse of the famous Cologne Cathedral. Here we saw 
the high bridge across the Rhine. I saw the floating bridge which Van Blue had the pleasure of crossing. 

From this point we traveled up the Rhine to Mainz. So many people have described the Rhine, and it is so 
beautiful, that I do not feel equal to it. One who has been to Europe and missed the trip up the Rhine with 
its famous old castles and castle ruins, the beautiful hills covered with vineyards, has certainly missed 
something grand. It seems impossible that hills so steep can be cultivated. Just at this time of the year with 
the Autumn colors the Rhine is especially beautiful, as Riley says, "It is a picture that no painter has the 
colorin' to mock." The river is full of river boats. Here is an excellent example of Government control. 
They river is improved everywhere to make a deep channel. We Americans might decrease the high cost of 
living by conserving our rivers more extensively than we do. 

More About CARL B. MCCAIN: 



Address (Facts Pg): 1910, Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana 

Occupation: 1910, School Teacher 

iv. EDWIN D. MCCAIN24, b. Abt. 1890, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. 1966, Carroll Co., Indiana; m. WIFE; b. 
Abt. 1890; d. Aft. 1970, Carroll Co., Indiana. 

More About EDWIN D. MCCAIN: 

Address (Facts Pg): 1910, Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana 

Occupation: 1910, Chauffer in Flora, Carroll County, Indiana 

v. J. REED MCCAIN24,25, b. Abt. 1892, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. Unknown; m. HOPE25; b. Abt. 1893, 
Indiana; d. Unknown. 

More About J. REED MCCAIN: 

Address (Facts Pg): 1930, Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co.,. Indiana 

Occupation: 1930, Automobile Salesman 

vi. FRANK K. MCCAIN26,27, b. Abt. 1899, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. Unknown. 

  

4. WILLIAM  F.
6 MCCAIN  (DAVID DILL

5, JAMES
4, JOHN

3, JAMES
2, DONALD

1)28,29,30 was born 01-January-1856 in 
Carroll County, Indiana, and died 1927 in Carroll County, Indiana. He married (2) ESTHER V. MYERS

30 05-
January-1895 in Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana, daughter of LEWIS MYERS and SARAH BALLARD . She 
was born 01-April-1865 in Hamilton County, Indiana, and died 23-May-1941 in Dallas Texas. 

More About WILLIAM  F. MCCAIN: 

Occupation: 1880, Farmer 

Notes for ESTHER V. MYERS: 

From the Flora Paper 

MRS. ESTHER MCCAIN PASSES AWAY AT DALLAS, TEXAS (Contributed) 

Mrs. Esther V. McCain, 76, a resident of Carrollton Township for many years, passed away in Dallas, 
Texas, on Friday, May 23, as a result of a stroke of paralysis, suffered two days earlier. She had gone to 
Dallas last October to spend the winter with a daughter, Mrs. Lester Quinn. The body was brought to 
Huntington, Ind., to the home of another daughter, Mrs. Glenn Dunkin. A short service was held at the 
home Sunday afternoon by Rev. J.E. Seaholm, pastor of the Baptist church there, after which the cortege 
came to the Sharon Baptist church, east of Flora, where services were conducted by Rev. J.E. Yarlan. Mrs. 
McCain had been a member of the Sharon church for many years. Burial was made in the adjoining 
cemetery. Esther V. Myers, daughter of Lewis and Sarah Myers, was born in Hamilton county, Indiana, 
April 1, 1865. A few years later the family moved to Cass county and later to Carroll County. She was 
married to William F. McCain on January 5, 1895, and they established their home on a farm adjoining the 
old McCain homestead in Carrollton township. Into this home, four children were born; a son, who died in 
infancy, and three daughters. She is survived by these daughters, Ruth, wife of Glenn Dunkin, of 
Huntington; Ruby, wife of Dr. Lester H. Quinn, of Dallas, Texas, and Love, wife of Rev. Arthur L. Miller, 
of Hutchinson, Kan.; eight grandchildren, one sister, Mrs. Dell Brunson, Carmel, Ind., and one brother, 



Bert H. Myers, Wolcott, Ind. The husband died in 1927, and one sister and two brothers also preceeded her 
in death. 

More About ESTHER V. MYERS: 

Cause of Death (Facts Pag: Stroke 

Cemetery: Beech Grove Cemetery, Sharon, Indiana 

Religion: Baptist 

More About WILLIAM  MCCAIN and ESTHER MYERS: 

Marriage: 05-January-1895, Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana 

Children of WILLIAM  MCCAIN  and ESTHER MYERS are: 

i. MCCAIN7, b. Abt. 1897; d. Abt. 1897. 

ii. ALMA RUTH MCCAIN 30, b. 04-December-1895, Carrollton Twsp, Carroll Co., Indiana31; d. 1992, 
Noblesville, Indiana; m. GLENN F. DUNKIN32, 23-March-1918, Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana; b. 
17-May-1895, Sharon, Indiana33; d. 1959, Huntington, Indiana34. 

Notes for ALMA RUTH MCCAIN: 

MISS RUTH M'CAIN AND GLENN F. DUNKIN ARE UNITED IN MARRIAGE 

One of the prettiest of the early spring weddings was that of Miss Alma Ruth McCain, 22, and Glenn F. 
Dunkin, 22, which was performed at the home of the bride's parents, Mr. and Mrs. William McCain, in 
Carrollton township, last Saturday afternoon at two o'clock. Rev. Donald J. Dunkin, of Camden, a cousin of 
the groom, performed the ceremony, which was one of those unostentatious affairs, only the immediate 
families and friends being present. The wedding march was played by Miss Mae McCain, a cousin of the 
bride and special music was furnished by the pastor and Mrs. Dunkin. Following the ceremony ice cream 
and cake were served. Besides the families the wedding guests included Mr. and Mrs. Donald Dunkin, 
Lester Quinn, Carl McCain and Misses Mae McCain, and Margaret Guard. During the afternoon the happy 
young couple left for Kokomo from where they took an evening train to Indianapolis where they remained 
until Sunday morning, when they left for Chattanooga to spend a few days' honeymoon and to visit points 
of historical interest. They arrived home yesterday and will make their home for a short time with their 
parents, at least until Mr. Dunkin ascertains his status in the draft. 

The bride is one of the best liked young ladies of Carrollton Township and is the oldest daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. William McCain. She graduated from the Flora schools in 1914, later taking advanced courses in the 
Muncie Normal School and Miss Blaker's School at Indianapolis. The past four terms she has been one of 
the efficient teachers at Gravel Hill. Mr. Dunkin is the only son of Mr. and Mrs. Winfield Dunkin, of 
Sharon. He graduated with the 1915 class of the Young America High School. For the past two years he 
has been associated with his father in the contracting business. Both are highly esteemed and will have the 
best wishes of their many friends for a long and happy wedded life. The Democrat joins with the many 
acquaintances in the extension of congratulations. 

More About ALMA RUTH MCCAIN: 

Burial: Carroll County, Indiana 

Cemetery: Beech Grove, Sharon, Indiana 

Notes for GLENN F. DUNKIN: 

MISS RUTH M'CAIN AND GLENN F. DUNKIN ARE UNITED IN MARRIAGE 



One of the prettiest of the early spring weddings was that of Miss Alma Ruth McCain, 22, and Glenn F. 
Dunkin, 22, which was performed at the home of the bride's parents, Mr. and Mrs. William McCain, in 
Carrollton township, last Saturday afternoon at two o'clock. Rev. Donald J. Dunkin, of Camden, a cousin of 
the groom, performed the ceremony, which was one of those unostentatious affairs, only the immediate 
families and friends being present. The wedding march was played by Miss Mae McCain, a cousin of the 
bride and special music was furnished by the pastor and Mrs. Dunkin. Following the ceremony ice cream 
and cake were served. Besides the families the wedding guests included Mr. and Mrs. Donald Dunkin, 
Lester Quinn, Carl McCain and Misses Mae McCain, and Margaret Guard. During the afternoon the happy 
young couple left for Kokomo from where they took an evening train to Indianapolis where they remained 
until Sunday morning, when they left for Chattanooga to spend a few days' honeymoon and to visit points 
of historical interest. They arrived home yesterday and will make their home for a short time with their 
parents, at least until Mr. Dunkin ascertains his status in the draft. 

The bride is one of the best liked young ladies of Carrollton Township and is the oldest daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. William McCain. She graduated from the Flora schools in 1914, later taking advanced courses in the 
Muncie Normal School and Miss Blaker's School at Indianapolis. The past four terms she has been one of 
the efficient teachers at Gravel Hill. Mr. Dunkin is the only son of Mr. and Mrs. Winfield Dunkin, of 
Sharon. He graduated with the 1915 class of the Young America High School. For the past two years he 
has been associated with his father in the contracting business. Both are highly esteemed and will have the 
best wishes of their many friends for a long and happy wedded life. The Democrat joins with the many 
acquaintances in the extension of congratulations. 

More About GLENN F. DUNKIN: 

Burial: Carroll County, Indiana 

Cemetery: Beech Grove, Sharon, Indiana 

Marriage Notes for ALMA MCCAIN and GLENN DUNKIN: 

Carroll County, Indiana 

Index to Marriage Records 

1850-1920 Inclusive 

Volume I 

Letters A - L Inclusive 

Name: Glenn F Dunkin 

Spouse: Ruth McCain 

Marriage Date: 23 Mar 1918 

Date: 17 May 1895 

Book: 17 

OSPage: 210 

County: Carroll 

Carroll County, Indiana 

Index to Marriage Records 

1850-1920 Inclusive 

Volume I 



Letters A - L Inclusive 

Name: John C Hughes 

Spouse: Marybelle Dunkin 

Marriage Date: 25 May 1918 

Date: 28 Mar 1896 

Book: 17 

OSPage: 232 

County: Carroll 

  

More About GLENN DUNKIN and ALMA MCCAIN: 

Marriage: 23-March-1918, Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana 

iii. RUBY MCCAIN 35, b. Abt. 1897, Carrollton Twsp, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. Unknown, Dallas Texas; m. 
DOCTOR LESTER H. QUINN; b. Abt. 1897, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. Unknown, Dallas Texas. 

More About DOCTOR LESTER H. QUINN: 

Occupation: Physician 

iv. LOVE J. MCCAIN35, b. Abt. 1902, Carrollton Twsp, Carroll Co., Indiana; d. Unknown, Hutchinson, 
Kansas?; m. REVERAND ARTHUR L. MILLER; b. Unknown; d. Unknown, Hutchinson, Kansas?. 

More About REVERAND ARTHUR L. MILLER: 

Occupation: Minister 

  

  

Endnotes 

1. 1830 Turtle Creek Twp., Warren Co., Ohio Census. 

2. 1870 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

3. 1880 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

4. 1870 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

5. 1850 Carroll County, Indiana Census. 

6. 1870 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

7. 1880 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

8. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 



9. 1850 Carroll County, Indiana Census. 

10. 1870 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

11. 1870 Indiana Carroll County Census. 

12. 1880 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

13. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

14. 1870 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

15. 1880 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

16. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

17. 1930 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co. Indiana Census. 

18. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

19. 1930 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co. Indiana Census. 

20. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

21. 1930 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co. Indiana Census. 

22. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

23. 1930 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co. Indiana Census. 

24. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

25. 1930 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co. Indiana Census. 

26. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

27. 1930 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co. Indiana Census. 

28. 1870 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

29. 1880 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

30. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

31. date taken from marriage license. 

32. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

33. date taken from marriage license. 

34. Found on Tombstone. 

35. 1910 Carrollton Twp., Carroll Co., Indiana Census. 

 


